
Total No. of Bidders: 
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids: 
IFB NO.: 22000245  

 BULK CHEMICALS, TREATING 

WATER AND WASTEWATER
OPENING DATE: April 5, 2022
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER: Stacey Sells

Brief Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1. SODIUM BISULFITE - BULK REF 

STANDARD- AWWA B601 No Bid $329,280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2. MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE - BULK 

MINIMUM OF 56-62 % No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3. FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $382,695.00 No Bid 

4. FLUOROSILICIC ACID - BULK No Bid No Bid $96,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5. MICRO C 2000 - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,421,368.00 No Bid No Bid 

6. PHOSPHORIC ACID 36% BULK 55 

GALLON DRUMS $30,690.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7. METHANOL - BULK No Bid No Bid $707,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8. FERROUS SULFATE - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9. SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 

BULK No Bid No Bid $409,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10. POLY ALUMINUM CHLORIDE 

DELPAC XG FORMULATION - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137,739.00

Chemrite Inc Southern Ionics Univar Solutions Momar Inc Kemira Water USALCO Baltimore



Total No. of Bidders: 
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids: 
IFB NO.: 22000245  

 BULK CHEMICALS, TREATING 

WATER AND WASTEWATER
OPENING DATE: April 5, 2022
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER: Stacey Sells

Brief Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1. SODIUM BISULFITE - BULK REF 

STANDARD- AWWA B601 $551,250.00 No Bid No Bid $989,310.00 No Bid No Bid 

2. MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE - BULK 

MINIMUM OF 56-62 % No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $340,855.50

3. FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK $417,570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4. FLUOROSILICIC ACID - BULK No Bid $56,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5. MICRO C 2000 - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6. PHOSPHORIC ACID 36% BULK 55 

GALLON DRUMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7. METHANOL - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid $713,710.00 No Bid No Bid 

8. FERROUS SULFATE - BULK No Bid No Bid $20,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9. SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 

BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid $438,750.00 $1,170,000.00 No Bid 

10. POLY ALUMINUM CHLORIDE 

DELPAC XG FORMULATION - BULK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Premier MagnesiaPVC Chemicals Pencco Inc Evoqua Water Intercoastal Trading Kuehne Chemical



Total No. of Bidders: 
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids: 
IFB NO.: 22000245  

 BULK CHEMICALS, TREATING 

WATER AND WASTEWATER
OPENING DATE: April 5, 2022
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER: Stacey Sells

Brief Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Price

1. SODIUM BISULFITE - BULK REF 

STANDARD- AWWA B601 No Bid

2. MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE - BULK 

MINIMUM OF 56-62 % No Bid

3. FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK No Bid

4. FLUOROSILICIC ACID - BULK No Bid

5. MICRO C 2000 - BULK No Bid

6. PHOSPHORIC ACID 36% BULK 55 

GALLON DRUMS $67,017.50

7. METHANOL - BULK No Bid

8. FERROUS SULFATE - BULK No Bid

9. SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 

BULK No Bid

10. POLY ALUMINUM CHLORIDE 

DELPAC XG FORMULATION - BULK No Bid

Under Review

Shannon Chemical


