
Total No. of Bidders: 2
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids: 
IFB NO.: 21000261  

 UTILITY FIRE HYDRANTS, WATER 

METER BOXES, VALVES AND 

ASSOCIATED PARTS
OPENING DATE: APRIL 6, 2021
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER:  ANNETTE LESCALLETT

Brief Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

GROUP A

1

COUPLING, HYMAX, WATER MAIN 

COUPLINGS,18 " HYMAX COUPLING,

19.50 - 21.60 11 EA

2

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 3" HYMAX 

COUPLING WITH 1.5" OUTLET 21 EA

3

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS,4" HYMAX 

COUPLING WITH 1.5" OUTLET 31 EA

4

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 2" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 2.1 - 3.0 WIDE RANGE 17 EA

5

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 3" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 3.46 - 4.29 WIDE RANGE 22 EA

6

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 4" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 4.25 - 5.11 WIDE RANGE 34 EA

7

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 8" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 8.54 - 9.84 WIDE RANGE 80 EA

8

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 12" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 12.4 - 13.66 LOW RANGE 29 EA

9

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 10" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 10.7 - 12.0 WIDE RANGE 37 EA

10

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 12" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 13.15 - 14.41 WIDE RANGE 37 EA

11

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 6" HYMAX 2 

BOLT, 6.42 - 7.68 52 EA

12

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 20" HYMAX 

COUPLING, 21.50-22.60 22 EA

13

WATER MAIN COUPLINGS, 16" HYMAX 1 

BOLT, 17.10 - 19.20 14 EA

14

6" HYMAX REDUCER, 6.22-7.48 X 7.48-8.74

12 EA

15

WATER MAIN 1 1/2" HYMAX COUPLING, 

1.16 - 2.13 O.D. 42 EA

16

HYMAX COUPLING, 2" FLANGE ADAPTOR

16 EA

17

HYMAX, EZ-MAX, FITTINGS, ALL ITEMS 

NOT LISTED ABOVE,

% DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST 

PRICE
25,000.

00 LS

GROUP A SUBTOTAL (EXTENDED 

PRICES) FOR ALL HYMAX BID LINES (1-

17)
158,424.62 187,305.28

GROUP C

Ferguson Enterprises Core and Main LP



90

EXTENSION KIT 24", FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B, AMERICAN 

FLOW 11 EA

91

FIRE HYDRANT COMPLETE, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-62-B 4.5 FT AMERICAN FLOW 101 EA

92

O-RING, STEAMER NOZZLE, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 5 EA

93

O-RING, HOUSING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 11 EA

94

O-RING, HOSE NOZZLE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 5 EA

95

O-RING, SLEEVE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 11 EA

96

O-RING, SEAT RING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 6 EA

97

OPERATING NUT, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B, OPERATING 

NUT 3 EA

98

O-RING, COVER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING,B-84-B 2 EA

99

O-RING, HOSE NOZZLE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 3 EA

100

VALVE BOTTOM, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 2 EA

101

FLANGE, BARREL, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 2 EA

102

HYDRANT SPRING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 2 EA

103

TRAVEL STOP NUT, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 2 EA

104

COVER, WEATHER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 2 EA

105

COVER, HOUSING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 250 EA

106

HOUSING, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING, B-62-B 86 EA

107

STOP NUTS, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING, B-62-B 201 EA

108

BOLTS/NUTS, BARREL, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B, NON- 

BREAKABLE 202 EA

109

BOLTS, BREAKABLE BARREL, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B, 224 EA

110

PIN, SPRING PLATE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 76 EA

111

PLATE, SPRING,FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 76 EA

112

SPRING, HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING, 

B-62-B 103 EA

113

BOLTS & NUTS, BASE, FIRE HYDRANTS, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 224 EA



114

PIN, SPRING PLATE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 78 EA

115

DRAIN LEVER, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING, B-84-B 52 EA

116

REPAIR KIT, TRAFFIC, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 156 EA

117

COMPLETE FIRE HYDRANT, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 5-

1/4" 22 EA

118

EXTENSION KIT 6", FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 22 EA

119

EXTENSION KIT 12", FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 22 EA

120

EXTENSION KIT 18", FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 11 EA

121

CAP, STEAMER NOZZLE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-84-B 2 EA

122

CAP, STEAMER NOZZLE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 30 EA

123

RIVETS, DRAIN LEVER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING, B-62-B 88 EA

124

S-HOOK, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING, B-62-B #62-23-2 2 EA

125

BASE (SHOE), FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING, B-62-B 51 EA

126

FIRE HYDRANT COMPLETE, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-62-B 4.5 FT AMERICAN FLOW - 

SHOE TYPE 51 EA

127

FIRE HYDRANT COMPLETE, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-62-B 4.5 FT AMERICAN FLOW - 

SCREW IN 51 EA

128

RIVETS, DRAIN LEVER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 66 EA

129

GASKET, COVER,FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 81 EA

130

GASKET, HOUSING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 80 EA

131

GASKET, STEAMER CAP, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 31 EA

132

GASKET, HOSE CAP, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 53 EA

133

NOZZLE, HOSE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 2 EA

134

SCREW SET, NOZZLE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 11 EA

135

GASKET, BARREL, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 5 EA

136

GASKET, DRAIN RING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B, GASKET, 

DRAIN/ RING AM 11 EA

137

GASKET, BASE, FIRE HYDRANT 

,AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 2 EA



138

O-RING, INSIDE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 6 EA

139

COVER CAP SCREW, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 2 EA

140

GASKET, COVER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 4 EA

141

GASKET, HOUSING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 4 EA

142

HOUSING, BOLTS & NUTS, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 12 EA

143

BARREL, UPPER,FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMRICAN DARLING B-84-B 2 EA

144

BARREL, LOWER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 2 EA

145

HOSE NOZZLE, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 2 EA

146

STEAMER NOZZLE, O-RING, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 2 EA

147

DRAIN RING, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-84-B 22 EA

148

GASKET, DRAIN RING, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 33 EA

149

WEATHER SHIELD, RUBBER, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 22 EA

150

CAP SCREWS, HOUSING CVR, FIRE 

HYDRANT, AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 86 EA

151

CAP, STEAMER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 51 EA

152

NOZZLE STEAMER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B 26 EA

153

CAP HOSE, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-62-B 51 EA

154

CAP CHAIN, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-62-B 2 EA

155

HOUSING COVER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 22 EA

156

O-RING, SEAT, FIRE HYDRANT, AMERICAN 

DARLING B-84-B 66 EA

157

NOZZLE, STEAMER, FIRE HYDRANT, 

AMERICAN DARLING B-84-B 22 EA

158

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, BREAKABLE ROD COUPLING 66 EA

159

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, SAFETY REPAIR KIT 79 EA

160

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, HOUSING 11 EA

161

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, SPRING PLATE 2 EA

162

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, BARREL GASKET 5 EA

163

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, BASE BOLTS & NUTS 4 EA



164

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, FLANGE, BASE 5 EA

165

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, BARREL FLANGE, NON-BREAKABLE 2 EA

166

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, BREAKABLE FLANGE 6 EA

167

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, STEAMER GASKET 6 EA

168

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, BRIDGE PIN WITH CLEVIS CLIP 6 EA

169

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, TOP SECTION, COMPLETE 2 EA

170

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, PIPE PLUG 3 EA

171

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, OPERATING NUT 5 EA

172

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, THRUST WASHER 2 EA

173

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, DRAIN LEVER 2 EA

174

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, DRAIN LEVER WASHER 6 EA

175

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, SEAT RING 3 EA

176

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, DRAIN RING 3 EA

177

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, LOWER ROD, 51 1/2" 2 EA

178

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, UPPER ROD, 24 1/4" 3 EA

179

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, DRAIN LEVER WASHERS 4 EA

180

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, HYDRANT SEAT 2 EA

181

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, BRIDGE PIN WITH CLEVIS CLIP 10 EA

182

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT B-84-

B, SNAP RINGS 5 EA

183

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, BRIDGE PIN W/ CLEVIS PIN 5 EA

184

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, THRUST WASHER 5 EA

185

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, HOUSING O-RING 3 EA

186

AMERICAN DARLING HYDRANT, B-62-B, 

UPPER VALVE ROD, 22" 2 EA

187

AMERICAN DARLING HYDRANT B-62-B, 

LOWER BARREL 47 1/2" 2 EA

188

AMERICAN DARLING HYDRANT B-62-B 

LOWER MAIN VALVE/ ROD 2 EA

189

VALVE, TOP, AMERICAN DARLING 

HYDRANT B-62-B 2 EA



190

MAIN VALVE, AMERICAN DARLING FIRE 

HYDRANT, B-62-B 5 EA

191

VALVE, BOTTOM, AMERICAN DARLING 

FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-B 2 EA

192

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, BARREL BOLTS & NUTS, STAINLESS 

STEEL 12 EA

193

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, VALVE TOP 2 EA

194

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, HYDRANT VALVE 3 EA

195

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, EXTENSION KIT, 6" 5 1/4" VO 5 EA

196

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, EXTENSION KIT, 12" 5 1/4" VO 2 EA

197

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, EXTENSION KIT,18" 5 1/4" 2 EA

198

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, EXTENSION KIT, 24" 5 1/4" 2 EA

199

HOUSING, O-RING, AMERICAN DARLING 

FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-B 5 EA

200

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-62-

B, SNAP RING 6 EA

201

AMERICAN DARLING HYDRANT, B-84-B, 

PIPE PLUG 84-5-3 5 EA

202

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, WEATHER COVER 2 EA

203

AMERICAN DARLING FIRE HYDRANT, B-84-

B, LOWER BARREL FLANGE 2 EA

204

EXTENSION KIT, AMERICAN DARLING 

HYDRANT, B-84-B 2 EA

205

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B BONNETT 

REPAIR KIT 100 EA

206

AMERICAN DARLING B-62-B TRAFFIC 

REPAIR KIT 100 EA

207

AMERICAN DARLING FOOT B-62-B VALVE 

REPAIR KIT 100 EA

208

AMERICAN FLOW CONTROL, (INCLUDING 

AMERICAN DARLING) ALL

ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE, % DISCOUNT 

OFF MANUFACTURER LIST PRICE

25,000.

00 LS

GROUP C SUBBTOTAL (EXTENDED 

PRICES) FOR ALL AMERICAN FLOW 

(INDLUDING AMERICAN DARLING)  BID 

LINES (90-208) 807,517.11 NO BID

GROUP D

209

CLOW VALVE COMPLETE FIRE 

HYDRANTS ONLY (POWER COATED 

ONLY),

PER SPECIFICATIONS. FACTOR TO BE 

APPLIED TO THE MANUFACTURER'S 

PRICE LIST 5 EA



210

CLOW VALVE PARTS FOR FIRE 

HYDRANTS, AND ACCESSORIES ONLY, 

PER

SPECIFICATIONS. FACTORE TO BE 

APPLIED TO THE MANUFACTURER'S 

PRICE LIST. 10 EA

211

CLOW VALVE INSERT FIRE HYDRANTS, 

PER SPECIFICATIONS. FACTOR TO BE 

APPLIED TO THE MANUFACTURER'S 

PRICE LIST 10 EA

212

CLOW VALVE EXTENSIONS AND REPAIR 

KITS FOR FIREHYDRANTS, PER

SPECIFICATIONS. FACTOR TO BE 

APPLIED TO THE MANUFACTURER'S 

PRICE LIST 10 EA

GROUP D SUBTOTAL (EXTENDED 

PRICES) FOR ALL CLOW VALVE CO.  BID 

LINES (209-212) NO BID NO BID

GROUP E

213

FORD METER BOX COMPANY, % 

DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST 

PRICE

80,000.

00 LS 5% 59%

214

HARRINGTON CORPORATION, % 

DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST 

PRICE

25,000.

00 LS 32% 25%

215

OLDCASTLE (METER VAULTS AND 

EXTENSIONS),

% DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST 

PRICE

25,000.

00 LS 31% NO BID

216

KURANDA USA, HOG PUMP, ALL ITEMS, % 

DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER LIST 

PRICE

5,000.0

0 LS 15% NO BID


