
Ferguson Enterprises EJ USA Inc.
Delmarva Castings & 

Supply LLC

Group A
 $               193,760.00 182,662.00$                 218,920.00$             

Group B
35,980.00$                  28,846.50$                   40,354.00$               

Group C
8,092.25$                    9,290.75$                      10,952.50$               

Group D
6,846.00$                    5,695.20$                      6,486.60$                  

Group E
49,882.00$                  38,799.60$                   39,858.00$               

Group F
112,000.00$               96,089.00$                   113,431.00$             

Group G
61,040.00$                  45,815.60$                   82,050.00$               

Group H No  Bid 59,036.60$                   36,421.50$               

Group I

45,913.00$                  14,971.70$                   No Bid 

Group J No Bid 9,886.00$                      No Bid 

Group K 1,848.00$                    2,646.00$                      No Bid 

Group L 196.00$                       510.00$                         No Bid 

Group M 259.00$                       617.40$                         No Bid 

Group N 322.00$                       697.80$                         No Bid 

Group O 448.00$                       885.80$                         No Bid 

Group P 476.00$                       1,073.80$                      No Bid 

Group Q 826.00$                       1,422.60$                      No Bid 

Group R 3,752.00$                    5,871.60$                      6,604.00$                  

Group S 1,155.00$                    2,864.00$                      No Bid 

Group T 5,796.00$                    5,574.45$                      6,240.00$                  

528,591.25$               513,256.40$                 561,317.60$             

9/19/2023                    IFB23000321, Iron Castings, Gray           Bid Tab 


